
 

 

 

 

 

 

English  Worship 9:30 AM (Main Sanctuary) 

Praise    Pastor Oliver/Praise Team 

Prayer    Carl Ross   

Offering Song   TFBC Choir 

    "Holy Ground" 

Welcome/Announcements Pastor Oliver Lee 

Message   Acts 21:10-14 

    “Being energetic for God.” 

                            Pastor Oliver Lee 

Praise    Praise Team 

Benediction   Pastor Oliver Lee 

 

  

Youth/EM Young Adults Worship 11:00 AM (Antioch) 

Announcements  Inreach Team 

Welcome   Inreach Team 

Praise    David Walker/Praise Team 

Prayer / Offering  Joy Park 

Scripture Reading  Philippians 1:1-11 

    Lynn Schreck    

Message   Pastor Jeremiah Hahn 

Praise    David Walker/Praise Team 

Closing Prayer   Pastor Jeremiah Hahn 

Ministry Staff 

 Senior Pastor        Sung E. David Choi  

 EM Pastor        Oliver Lee / 210-454-8250 

 KM Sml Group/ Ed/ Admin Pastor      Cheol-Gi Min/ 253-535-5803 

 Associate Pastor/Bld Admin      Gwang An /253-335-9101 

 Music/Worship Pastor       YoonHeang Cho/702-472-2932 

 Young Adults/Finance Admin Pasto r      Jake Ahn / 253-365-1105 

 Youth Pastor           Jeremiah Hahn / 415-328-6899 

 Children Ministry Minister  Ellen Kim /502-526-1013 

 Media/KCM Pastor        Joosung Kim / 615-419-2905 

 Visitation Minister         Pong S. Ogle / 253-359-7869 

 Secretary    M. Turner 

     J. Kirkwood 

 Custodian    Myong S. Henry 

 Maintenance     In Do Kim 

 

EM Deacons: 

Michael Galvin(OD)        Richard Detheridge(OD) 

Dennis Tabb       Donald Murray    

Gene Parinas                   Ken Adkins      

Steve Weideman                  Etienne Rudegeair 

James Roberts                  Carl Ross 

Tim Lang   Clyde Maxwell  

Phillip Zumuda         Danny Williamson     

Ken Henry         Tony Losito 

Rose Dycus  

 

EM Sunday School Teachers: 

Bud Earp / O-18                   Clarence Turner / N-117        

Roger Law / N-208           Rick Stenstrom / E-101 

Etienne Rudegeair / N-205               Seon Cho/ /N-202 

 

EM Team Leaders: 

 Evangelism Team:   Steve Weideman    

 Outreach Team:    Michael Galvin 

 Welcoming Team:   Tammy Brooks 

 Ushers Team:    Tim Lang 

 Praise Team                                  Frank Torres 

 Choir Team:     James Roberts 

 

EM Jesus Village Leaders 

Roger Law      Rudy Rudegeair         Rick Detheridge 

Bud Earp      Butch Shadduck         Danny Williamson 
 

YOUTH/YOUNG ADULTS Ministry Team Leaders 

Worship/Media Team:    

Outreach Team:   Angela Kwak 

Inreach Team:   Sukwoo Lee 

Welcoming Team:  Joseph Kang (Interim) 

 

YAM Village Leaders 

Marcella Tomlin  Eric Han     Andrew Kang  

 

Acts 21:10-14 

10 After we had been 
there a number of days, a 
prophet named Agabus 
came down from Judea. 
11 Coming over to us, he 
took Paul’s belt, tied his 
own hands and feet with 
it and said, “The Holy 
Spirit says, ‘In this way 
the Jewish leaders in Je-
rusalem will bind the 
owner of this belt and 
will hand him over to the 
Gentiles.’”12 When we 
heard this, we and the 
people there pleaded 
with Paul not to go up to 
Jerusalem. 13 Then Paul 
answered, “Why are you 
weeping and breaking 
my heart? I am ready not 
only to be bound, but 
also to die in Jerusalem 
for the name of the Lord 
Jesus.” 14 When he 
would not be dissuaded, 
we gave up and said, 
“The Lord’s will be done.” 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

“Being energetic for God.” 

Do nothing out of selfish ambition or vain conceit. Rather, in humil-

ity value others above yourselves, 4 not looking to your own inter-

ests but each of you to the interests of the others. Philippians 2:3-4 

February 16, 2014 



English Worship Service (Main Sanctuary)  @ 9:30  AM    

Youth / Young Adult Service    (Antioch)            @ 11:00AM\ 

 

EM Wednesday Service (Antioch)  @ 7:00  PM 

 

Youth Friday (Antioch)    @ 7:00  PM 

YAM Friday (Youth Room)   @ 7:30  PM 

EM Announcements 

1. Welcome to TFBC ELM Worship Service. 

2. Sunday Luncheon Sign up. If you want to do a special  

    designated offering for Sunday Lunch. Please sign up at the  

    lobby. 

3. Pledging Commitment Card of Planting a tree Campaign is  

    going on. Please pray and fill out the card and submit in the   

    box at the lobby. Also please use the green envelop for the  

    offering of the pledging with designated offering.  

   Planting a tree campaign: 300 trees / $360,000 pledged. 

   Offering Total as of this week:  $92,827.00 

4. No Youth/YAM program this Friday (Feb 21). 

5. Awana team is in need of a teacher for 3rd to 6th graders and  

    also volunteer/helper. New semester started last week.  

     TFBC Awana team placed 2nd in Bible Quiz.  

6. Awana Ice Skating. Feb 19 (Wed) We will leave at 5:45PM  

    from church and return by 8:15PM. Fee: $7.00. Sign up for the  

    event.  

7. Intercessory Prayer Team started. Please sign up at the lobby.  

8. Jesus Village Leaders Retreat. Feb 21-22, 2PM to 2PM(Next  

     Day) Camp Arnold. Fee: $25 for Village Leaders and $50 for  

     Non-village Leaders. Please sign up at the lobby with detailed  

     information regarding a number and lodging. Pick up the  

     direction and things to bring list from the lobby. 

9.  Youth and YAM in need of Volunteer drivers from Down  

     town Tacoma Area to Church.  

10. Korean Global Mission Conf. Feb 24-28. (Senior Pastor,  

     Emeritus Pastor, and Ordained Deacons will be attending) 

 

Admin Announcements 

1. Please do not leave valuables in the car (in visible sight) Make  

    sure you lock your vehicle in the parking lot. 

2. To request offering report of 2013 for tax purpose, please sign    

    up at the lobby table by the office to request a copy of  

    contribution report for year 2013. 

3. Please continue to pray for the Parking Lot construction. The   

    company for the construction will be announced on Feb. 23. 

4. Church Daycare is hiring. For more info Please contact  

    253-535-9435. 

5. Mrs. Ellen Kim (Pastor Joosung Kim’s Wife) will be serving as  

    a volunteer Children’s minister as of today. 

 EM Worship Prayer 

 2/16  Carl Ross  3/2  James Roberts 

 2/23  Dennis Tabb  3/9  Danny Williamson 

Youth and YAM Worship Prayer and Scripture Reading 

 2/16  Lynn Schreck 

 Tim Joo 

    

    

February 
21-23 Jesus Village Leaders Retreat (Camp Arnold) 
24-28 Korean Global Mission Conf (San Jose, CA) Senior Pastor, 

Pastor in Emeritus, and Ordained Deacons. 

March 
2 Communion 
8-9 Ministry Expo 
15 Healing 153 
16-25 Venezuela Mission Trip 

1. Silver Community Meeting Feb 21 (Fri) Antioch. 

2. KM Intercessory Prayer Seminar Feb 26 (Wed) Main. 

1. Youth Sunday Bible Study - every Sunday @ 9:30AM 

2. There is no Youth/YAM Friday this coming week due to  

    Jesus Village leaders retreat. Feb 21. 

4. YAM Meeting today at 1PM. 

5. Awana team is in need of a teacher for 3rd to 6th graders and  

     also volunteer/helper. 6:45PM(Wednesdays) 

6. Youth Discipleship Sat 1PM, Sun 1PM. 

 


